NOTICE OF ADOPTED ORDINANCE

Pursuant to Section 7-3 of the Town of Castle Rock Home Rule Charter, notice is
hereby given that the Town Council did adopt the following named and described
Ordinance during a Regular Meeting on June 18, 2019, which commenced at
6:00 P.M. at the Castle Rock Town Council Chambers, 100 N. Wilcox St. Castle
Rock, CO 80104

Title of Adopted Ordinance: _ Ordinance No. 2019-012

An Ordinance Repealing and Reenacting Chapters 15.04, 15.06, 15.08,
15.10, 15.12, 15.14, 15.16, 15.18, 15.24, 15.26 and 15.28 of the Castle Rock
Municipal Code; Adopting by Reference as Primary Codes The 2018
Editions of the International Building Code, International Residential Code for
One- And Two-Family Dwellings, International Mechanical Code,
International Plumbing Code, International Energy Conservation Code,
Intemational Fuel Gas Code, International Fire Code , International Existing
Building Code, International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, ANSI A117.1-
2009, ASME A17.1-2013, ASME A18.1-2011, ASME A17.3-2005, ASCE 21
Parts 1-4, with Amendments; Adopting by Reference as a Primary Code The
2017 Edition of the National Electrical Code, with Amendments; Providing
Penalties for Violations Thereof; Repealing Chapter 15.20; and Making Minor
Editorial Amendments To Chapters 15.22 and 15.30

Subject Matter Summary:

This is a comprehensive periodic update of the International Codes. Said
ordinance adopts, by reference, as primary code the following codes and
standards (as defined in C.R.S. 31-16-202)

International Building Code 2018 Edition — May 2018

International Residential Code One- and Two-Family Dwellings — August
2017

International Mechanical Code - 2017

International Plumbing Code - 2017

International Energy Conservation Code - 2017

International Fuel Gas Code - 2017

International Fire Code — August 2017

International Existing Building Code 2017

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code - 2017

Published by:

International Code Council, Inc.
4051 West Flossmoor Road
Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795



International Fire Code
Published by:

International Code Council, Inc.
4051 West Flossmoor Road
Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795
August 2017

ASME A17.1-2013 Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators - October 21,
2013

ASME A18.1-2011 Safety Standard for Platform Lifts and Stairway
Chairlifts -October 31, 2011

ASME A17.3-2005 Safety Code for Existing Elevators and Escalators —
March 31, 2006

Published by:

American Society of Mechanical Engineers
2 Park Avenue

New York, NY 10016-5990

*As regulated and adopted by the State, Code of Colorado Regulations (7
CCR 1101-8 and CRS Title 9, Article 5.5)

ANSI A117.1-2009 Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities
Published by:

International Code Council

4051,W. Flossmoor Road

Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795

January 2013

ASCE 21 Parts 1-4 Automated People Mover Standards
Published by:

American Society of Civil Engineers

1801 Alexander Bell Drive

Reston, VA 20191
January 1, 2013



National Electrical Code 2017 Edition
Published by:

National Fire Protection Association
One Batterymarch Park

Quincy, MA 02169-7471

August 24, 2016

Copies of each code and the entire text of the proposed ordinance is available for
public inspection at the office of the Town Clerk, 100 North Wilcox, Castle Rock,
Colorado 80104 during normal working hours between 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m.,
Monday through Friday, excluding holidays.

Newspaper publication date: May 30, 2019
Newspaper publication date: June 6, 2019

Publication Date: June 21, 2019



ORDINANCE NO. 2019-012

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING AND REENACTING CHAPTERS 15.04, 15.06, 15.08,
15.10, 15.12, 15.14, 15.16, 15.18, 15.24, 15.26 AND 15.28 OF THE CASTLE ROCK
MUNICIPAL CODE; ADOPTING BY REFERENCE AS PRIMARY CODES THE 2018
EDITIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE,
INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, INTERNATIONAL FUEL
GAS CODE, INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE , INTERNATIONAL EXISTING
BUILDING CODE, INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE, ANSI
Al117.1-2009, ASME A17.1-2013, ASME A18.1-2011, ASME A17.3-2005, ASCE 21
PARTS 1-4, WITH AMENDMENTS; ADOPTING BY REFERENCE AS A PRIMARY
~ CODE THE 2017 EDITION OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, WITH

AMENDMENTS; PROVIDING PENALTIES FOR VIOLATIONS THEREOF;
REPEALING CHAPTER 15.20; AND MAKING MINOR EDITORIAL
AMENDMENTS TO CHAPTERS 15.22 AND 15.30

WHEREAS, the Town of Castle Rock is a home rule municipal corporation and the Town
Council is empowered to adopt such ordinances as are necessary and convenient to protect the
health, safety and welfare of the community; and

WHEREAS, the Town Council has determined the necessity of adopting regulations and
standards to govemn in a safe, fair and equitable manner the construction of buildings and
structures in the Town; and

WHEREAS, the codes and standards are established and periodically updated by
nationally recognized professional and technical organizations, together with local amendments
and serve as the most practical basis for regulating construction.

NOW, THEREFORE, IT IS ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE
TOWN OF CASTLE ROCK, COLORADO:

Section 1. Repeal and Reenactment. Chapter 15.04 of the Castle Rock Municipal
Code is repealed in its entirety and reenacted to read as follows:

Chapter 15.04
International Building Code

15.04.010 Adoption.

A. The Town adopts by reference the following code: International Building Code, 2018
Edition (appendices to the International Building Code are only adopted to the extent specified by
the user and with Chief Building Official approval), for regulating and governing conditions and
maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied
utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure the structures are



safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures
unfit for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such structures, as hereafter set out
(published by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club
Hills, IL 60478-5795).

B.  The subject matter of the code concerns regulations to provide minimum requirements
to safeguard the public health, safety and general welfare through structural strength, means of
egress facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate light and ventilation, energy conservation and safety
to life and property from fire and other hazards attributed to the built environment; and to provide
safety to firefighters and emergency responders during emergency operations.

C.  One copy and an electronic copy of the above-referenced code shall be maintained on
file at the Development Services Department, and may be inspected during regular business hours,
the same being adopted as if set out at length herein.

15.04.020 Application.

The provisions of the adopted code shall apply to the construction, alteration, moving of
buildings, demolition, repair and use of any building or structure within the Town, except work
located primarily in a public way, public utility towers and poles, mechanical equipment not
specifically regulated by code and hydraulic flood control structures. Applicants may submit
permit applications and plan reviews in compliance with these adopted codes prior to August 1,
2019. Master Production Plans, those submitted to the Town for reuse on a minimum of four
structures, should comply with the provisions in these adopted codes by January 1, 2020. Required
construction documents shall be submitted electronically, in PDF format. Construction drawings
shall be drawn to an appropriate scale. Any document (plans, drawings, reports, surveys, etc.)
prepared by an architect or engineer must bear such architect or engineers seal and signature.

15.04.030 Amendments.

The following amendments, additions and deletions are made to the International Building
Code:

A, Section 101.1 Title is amended to read as follows:

These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the Town of Castle Rock
and shall be cited as such and will be referred to herein as "this code."

B. Section 102.6 Existing Structures is amended to read as follows:

The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this code
shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in this code,
the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, the International Existing
Building Code, or the International Fire Code, or as is deemed necessary by the Chief
Building Official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public.

C.  The following definitions are hereby added to Section 202, Definitions:

2



ARCHITECT is a person licensed under the provisions of Title 12, Article 4,
CR.S.

BUILDING SITE is all that area, or those areas, encompassed by horizontal radii
of 150 feet measured outwardly from exterior structural walls, water wells, of the limits of
artificial grading, on-site sewage disposal systems or slope retaining devices, except where
limited by the parcel.

CIVIL ENGINEER is a person licensed under the provisions of Title 12, Article
25, Part I, C.R.S., and who is experienced and knowledgeable in the practice of civil
engineering.

CIVIL ENGINEERING is the application of the knowledge of the forces of
nature, principles of mechanics and the properties of materials to the evaluation, design
and construction of civil works for the beneficial uses of mankind.

C.R.S. is the Colorado Revised Statutes.

ENGINEERING GEOLOGIST is a professional geologist as defined in Section
34-1-201, C.R.S., and who is experienced and knowledgeable in the practice of engineering

geology.

ENGINEERING GEOLOGY is the application of geologic knowledge and
principles in the investigation and evaluation of naturally occurring rock and soil for use
in the design of civil works for the purpose of assuring that geological features and
processes affecting the planning, location, design, construction, operation and maintenance
of civil works are recognized and adequately interpreted.

LAND SURVEYOR is a person licensed under the provisions of Title 12, Article
25, Part 2, C.R.S.

SOIL ENGINEER is a person licensed under the provisions of Title 12, Article
25, Part 2, CR.S., and who is experienced and knowledgeable in the practice of soil
engineering. SOIL ENGINEERING is the application of the principles of soil mechanics
in the investigation, evaluation and design of civil works involving the use of earth
materials and the inspection and testing of the construction thereof.

D. A new Section 312 is added to read in its entirety as follows:

SECTION 312 - UTILITY AND MISCELLANEOUS GROUP U:

312.1 General. Buildings and structures of an accessory character and
miscellaneous structures not classified in any specific occupancy shall be
constructed, equipped and maintained to conform to the requirements of this code
commensurate with the fire and life hazard incidental to their occupancy. Group
U shall include, but not be limited to the follows:

3



Agricultural buildings

Aircraft hangars, accessory to a one- or two-family residence (see
Section 412.4)

Barns

Carports

Communication equipment structures

Fences more than 6 feet (1829 mm) in height
Grain silos, accessory to residential occupancy
Livestock shelters

Private garages

Retaining walls

Sheds

Stables

Tanks

Towers

S

BECRT PR MO A0

E. A new Section 723 is added to read in its entirety as follows:

SECTION 723 - DETERMINING FACTORS OF FIRE-RESISTIVE
MATERIALS AND CONSTRUCTION

723.1 General. Unless other requirements such as site plan review or other more
restrictive conditions apply, this section shall be applicable to all new buildings, additions
and repairs. (See Section 102.6.)

723.1.2 Centerlines of streets. For the purposes of this Chapter, the
centerline of an adjoining street or alley may be considered an adjacent property
line. Distance shall be measured at right angles to the street or alley.

723.1.3 Roof coverings. Except where Section 1505 and Table 1505.1 of
the International Building Code require greater protection, roof coverings for new
buildings or structures or additions thereto or roof coverings utilized for re-roofing
shall be Class A, Class B or Class C in accordance with Section 1505.

Fire-retardant shakes and shingles as determined by Section 1505.6 may be used if
installed per Section 1505.7 special purpose roofs in the International Building Code.

F. A new Section 1512 is added to read in its entirety as follows:

SECTION 1512 - ROOFS, ASSEMBLIES AND ROOFTOP STRUCTURES

1512.1 Roof drains. Unless roofs are sloped to drain over roof edges, roof drains
shall be installed at each low point of the roof.

Exception. R-3 dwellings on bump-out protrusions of 30 square feet or less.



1511.2 Overflow drains and scuppers. Where roof drains are required, overflow
drains having the same size as the roof drains shall be installed with the inlet flow
line located two inches above the low point of the roof, or overflow scuppers having
three times the size of the roof drains and having a minimum opening height of four
inches may be installed in the adjacent parapet walls with the inlet flow line located
two inches above the low point of the roof.

Overflow drains shall discharge to an approved location a minimum of five feet

from the foundation and shall not be connected to roof drain lines.

G.

Section 1608.1 is amended to read as follows:
SECTION 1608 - SNOW LOADS

1608.1 General. Design snow loads shall be determined in accordance with Section
7 of ASCE 7, but the design roof load shall not be less than that determined by
Section 1607. The snow load within the Town of Castle Rock shall be a minimum
of 35 pounds per square foot in elevations of 6,000 to 6,499, 40 pounds per square
foot in elevations of 6,500 to 7,000 and shall not be reducible. Ground Snow Load
= Snow Loads.

Subsection 1803.5.4 is amended to include the following:

Design water table. The design water table shall be the measurement or prediction
of the highest potential elevation of the water table at the building site where such
measurement or prediction is based upon a report by a soils engineer or other
qualified professional and where the accuracy of such measurement or prediction
considers the average annual rainfall or other sources or factors which may
influence fluctuations in the water table for the area in which the subject building
site is located. In cases where the water table may be artificially lowered, the design
water table must be determined subsequent to the completion of the sub drain
system. Provisions must be made for maintenance of the sub drain system, funds
for maintenances and individual or group responsibility for ongoing maintenance.

A new Section 1805.5 is added to read as follows:
SECTION 1805 - FOOTINGS AND FOUNDATIONS

1805.8.5 Slabs below grade. Building permits for structures with slabs below
grade shall not be issued unless the finished slab elevation is 6 inches or more above
the design water table.

1. Peripheral sub drain required. Structures with slabs below grade shall be
provided with a peripheral sub drain which slopes to a sump or sumps, daylight or
other approved point. In each case, the ultimate discharge points for peripheral sub
drains shall be approved during building permit application review.



J.

K.

2. Crawl spaces. Crawl spaces shall be permitted only where the design
water table is a minimum of 36 inches below the interior finished crawl space grade.

3. Alternative designs. Alternate designs and construction practices may be
permitted where it is demonstrated to the reasonable satisfaction of the Chief
Building Official that they are in compliance with the intent of the criteria listed
above.

Section 3109 is deleted in its entirety.

Add footnote H to Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures

to read as follows:

15.04.040

A.

H. Modifications to Drinking Fountains and Service Sinks may be made by the
Chief Building Official pursuant to Section 104.10, International Building Code.

Chapter 34 is deleted in its entirety.

A new Section 1102 is added to read as follows:
SECTION 1102 - COMPLIANCE

1102.1 Design. Buildings and facilities shall be designed and constructed to be
accessible in accordance with this code and 2017 ICC A117.1

Any reference to the ICCA117.1 shall be to the 2017 edition.
Section 1507.1.2 is amended to read as follows:

1507.1.2 Ice barriers. An ice barrier shall be installed on eaves and valleys for
asphalt shingles, metal roof shingles, mineral-surfaced roll roofing, slate and slate-
type shingles, wood shingles and wood shakes. The ice barrier shall consist of not
less than two layers of underlayment cemented together, or a self-adhering polymer
modified bitumen sheet shall be used in place of normal underlayment and extend
from the lowest edges of all roof surfaces to a point not less than 24-inches (610
mm) inside the exterior wall line of the building.

Exception: Detached accessory structures that do not contain conditioned
floor area.

Violation; penalty.

The Chief Building Official, Fire Code Official or any other designated Town

official shall be empowered to issue citations, stop work orders, cease and desist orders or closure
orders to any person found in violation of this Chapter.



B. Any person who violates any of the provisions of this Chapter shall be punished by
a fine of not more $1,000.00 or by imprisonment not to exceed one year, or by both such fine and
imprisonment.

C. Each such person shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every day during
any portion of which any violation is committed, continued or permitted by such person.

D. Commencement of work without a valid permit as required under this Title 15 may
be subject to payment of an additional fee equal to the original permit fee, and is in addition to the
required permit fee.

Section 2. Repeal and Reenactment. Chapter 15.06 of the Castle Rock Municipal Code
is repealed in its entirety and reenacted to read as follows:

Chapter 15.06
International Residential Code

15.06.010 Adoption.

A. The Town adopts by reference the following code: International Residential Code
for One- and Two-Family Dwellings, 2018 Edition, including Appendices A, B, C, G, H, J and M,
for regulating and governing the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement,
repair, equipment, location, removal and demolition of detached one- and two-family dwellings
and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three stories in height with
separate means of egress, as hereafter set out (published by the International Code Council, Inc.,
4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795).

B. The subject matter of the code concerns regulations to provide minimum
requirements to safeguard the public health, safety and general welfare through structural strength,
means of egress facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate light and ventilation, energy conservation
and safety to life and property from fire and other hazards attributed to the built environment; and
to provide safety to firefighters and emergency responders during emergency operations.

C. One copy and an electronic version of the above-referenced code shall be
maintained on file at the Development Services Department and may be inspected during regular
business hours, the same being adopted as if set out at length herein.

15.06.020 Application.

The provisions of the adopted code shall apply to the construction, alteration, moving of
buildings, demolition, repair and use of any building or structure within the Town, except work
located primarily in a public way, public utility towers and poles, mechanical equipment not
specifically regulated by code and hydraulic flood control structures. Applicants may submit
permit applications and plan reviews in compliance with these adopted codes prior to August 1,
2019. Master Production Plans, those submitted to the Town for reuse on a minimum of four
structures to be constructed within a platted subdivision (as defined in Title 16 of the Castle Rock
Municipal Code), should comply with the provisions in these adopted codes by January 1, 2020.

7



One copy of an engineer-stamped truss design, one engineer-stamped plan set along with one
electronic CD of each is required for all Master Production Plans. Required construction
documents shall be submitted electronically, in PDF format. Construction drawings shall be drawn
to an appropriate scale. Any document (plans, drawings, reports, surveys, etc.) prepared by an
architect or engineer must bear such architect or engineers seal and signature.

15.06.030

Amendments.

The following amendments, additions and deletions are made to the International
Residential Code:

A.

D.

Section R101.1 Title is amended to read as follows:

R101.1 Title. These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code for one-
and two-family dwellings of the Town of Castle Rock and shall be cited as such
and will be referred to herein as "this residential code."

Section R105.2, Item 2, is amended to read as follows:
Fences not over 6-feet (1829 mm) high.
Section R202 Definitions is amended to add the following definitions:

DECORATIVE COATINGS. A single coat of plaster, cementious or other
approved material applied to a concrete or masonry surface for aesthetic purposes
only.

FLOOR AREA, GROSS. The floor area within the inside perimeter of the
exterior walls of the building under consideration, exclusive of vent shafts and
courts, without deduction for corridors, stairways, closets, the thickness of interior
walls, columns or other features. The floor area of a building, or portion thereof,
not provided with surrounding exterior walls shall be the usable area under the
horizontal projection of the roof or floor above. This area could also include other
exterior space intended to be used as part of the space to be occupied. The gross
floor area shall not include shafts with no openings or interior courts.

Section R109.1 Foundation Inspection is amended to add a new Section R109.1.1.1

to read as follows:

E.

R109.1.1.1. Foundation compliance. Inspections shall be performed by a
professional engineer licensed in the State of Colorado or architect registered in the
state of Colorado. A stamped written report shall be provided to the building
official of the results for the inspection by a Colorado licensed professional
engineer or architect registered in the state of Colorado.

Section R301.2 Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria. Table R301.2 (1) is

amended to read as follows:




TABLE R301.2(1)
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

WIND DESIGN

GROUND SEISMIC SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM WINTER ICE BARRIER FLOOD AR MEAN
SNOW Speed d Topograehic Special Windborne DESIGN o] Frost . DESIGN UNDERLAYMENT HAZARDSS FREEZ| ANNUAL
LOAD® (mph) effects wind region! | debris zone™ CATEGORY' | Weathering®| |;no Termite TEMP® REQUIRED" NG i

ep
6000-6499 115 mph No No No B Severe 36” Slight to 1°F Yes a.05/26/19 867 48.1°F
35 psf Vult (Exposure moderate 88
6500-6999 is site specific) b.03/16/20
40 psf 16
C.**
MANUAL J DESIGN CRITERIA"
Elevation Latitude Winter Summer Altitude Indoor design Design Heating temperature
heating cooling correction factor temperature temperature cooling difference
6000-7000 feet 39°N 3° 90° 80 70° 75° 69°
Cooling temperature difference Wind velocity Wind velocity Coincident Daily Winter Summer _
heating cooling wet bulb range humidity humidity
15° 15 mph 7.5 mph 60° High (H) 40% 50% —

*ground snow load = roof snow load, reductions for snow loads are not allowed

**FIRMs: 08035C0166G, 08035C0167G, 08035C0168G, 08035C0169G, 08035C0186G, 08035C0187G, 08035C0188G, 08035C0189G, 08035C0191G, 08035C0192G, 08035C0193G,
08035C0282G, 08035C0284G, 08035C0301G, 08035C0302G, 08035C0303G, 08035C0304G, 08035C0306G Dated: 03/16/2016

08035C0283F, 08035C0292F, 08035C0310F Dated: 09/30/2005

For SI: 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s.

a. Where weathering requires a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to satisfy the structural requirements of this code, the frost line depth strength required for
weathering shall govern. The weathering column shall be filled in with the weathering index, “negligible,” “moderate” or “severe” for concrete as determined from Figure R301.2(4). The
grade of masonry units shall be determined from ASTM C34, C55, C62, C73, C90, C129, C145, C216 or C652.

b. Where the frost line depth requires deeper footings than indicated in Figure R403.1(1), the frost line depth strength required for weathering shall govern. The jurisdiction shall fill in
the frost line depth column with the minimum depth of footing below finish grade.

¢. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table to indicate the need for protection depending on whether there has been a history of local subterranean termite damage.

d. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the wind speed from the basic wind speed map [Figure R301.2(5)A]. Wind exposure category shall be determined on a site-specific
basis in accordance with SectionR301.2.1.4.

¢. The outdoor design dry-bulb temperature shall be selected from the columns of 97"/ -percent values for winter from Appendix D of the International Plumbing Code. Deviations from
the Appendix D temperatures shall be permitted to reflect local climates or local weather experience as determined by the building official. {Also see Figure R301.2(1).]

f. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the seismic design category determined from Section R301.2.2.1.

g. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with (a) the date of the jurisdiction’s entry into the National Flood Insurance Program (date of adoption of the first code or ordinance for
management of flood hazard areas), (b) the date(s) of the Flood Insurance Study and (c) the panel numbers and dates of the currently effective FIRMs and FBFMs or other flood hazard
map adopted by the authority having jurisdiction, as amended.

h. In accordance with Sections R905.1.2, R905.4.3.1, R905.5.3.1, R905.6.3.1, R905.7.3.1 and R905.8.3.1, where there has been a history of local damage from the effects of ice damming,
the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with “YES.” Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with “NO.”

i. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the 100-year return period air freezing index (BF-days) from Figure R403.3(2) or from the 100-year (99 percent) value on the
National Climatic Data Center data table “Air Freezing Index-USA Method (Base 32°F).”

Jj. Thejurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the mean annual temperature from the National Climatic Data Center data table “Air Freezing Index-USA Method (Base 32°F).”

k. In accordance with Section R301.2.1.5, where there is local historical data documenting structural damage to buildings due to topographic wind speed-up effects, the jurisdiction shall
fill in this part of the table with “YES.” Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate “NO” in this part of the table.

1. Inaccordance with Figure R301.2(5)A, where there is local historical data documenting unusual wind conditions, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with “YES” and
identify any specific requirements. Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate “NO” in this part of the table.

m. In accordance with Section R301.2.1.2 the jurisdiction shall indicate the wind-bome debris wind zone(s). Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate “NO” in this part of the table.

n. The jurisdiction shall fill in these sections of the table to establish the design criteria using Table 1a or 1b from ACCA Manual J or established criteria determined by the jurisdiction.

o. The jurisdiction shall fill in this section of the table using the Ground Snow Loads in Figure R301.2(6).




Section R303 LIGHT, VENTILATION, HEATING is amended to read as follows:
R303.1 Habitable rooms, is amended to add a new Exception 4 to read as follows:

4. The natural light requirement in basements of dwelling units or congregate
residences may. be reduced by 50%, except that sleeping rooms must meet the
requirements of Section R310.1

Section R313 is deleted in its entirety.

Section R315.3, amend Location to read as follows:

Carbon monoxide alarms in dwelling units shall be installed outside of each separate
sleeping area within fifteen feet of the entrance to each bedroom. Where a fuel-burning
appliance is located within a bedroom or its attached bathroom, a carbon monoxide
alarm shall be installed within the bedroom.

Section R315.2.2, Exception 2, is deleted in its entirety.

Section 507 Exterior Decks — Table R507.7, is amended to read as follows:

TABLE R507.7
MAXIMUM JOIST SPACING FOR DECKING

DECKING MATERIAL TYPE AND
NOMINAL SIZE

MAXIMUM ON-CENTER JOIST SPACING

Decking perpendicular to joist

Decking diagonal to joista

1 Y-inch-thick-wood 16 inches 12 inches
2-inch-thick-wood 24 inches 16 inches
Plastic composite 12 inches 12 inches

For SI: 1 inch — 25.4 mm, 1 foot — 304.8 mmi, 1 degree — 0.01745 rad.
a. Maximum angle of 45 degrees from perpendicular for wood deck boards.

K.

Section R905.1.2 is amended to read as follows:

R905.1.2 Ice barriers. As designed in Table R301.2(1), an ice barrier shall be installed
on eaves and valleys for asphalt shingles, metal roof shingles, mineral-surfaced roll
roofing, slate and slate-type shingles, wood shingles, and wood shakes. The ice barrier
shall consist of not less than two layers of underlayment cemented together, or a self-
adhering polymer modified bitumen sheet shall be used in place of normal
underlayment and extend from the lowest edges of all roof surfaces to a point not less
than 24 inches (610 mm) inside the exterior wall line of the building. On roofs with
slope equal to or greater than eight units vertical in 12 units horizontal (67-percent
slope), the ice barrier shall also be applied not less than 36 inches (914 mm) measured
along the roof slope from the eave edge of the building.

Exception: Detached accessory structures that do not contain conditioned floor area.

10



L. Section R905, Requirements for Roof Coverings, is amended by adding a new Section
R905.7.5.1 Wood shingle application, to read as follows:

R905.7.5.1 Wood shingle application. All Class C and wood shingles shall be
installed per Section 1505.7, Special purpose roofs, in the International Building Code.

M. Section G2408.5 (305.8) Clearances to combustible construction is amended by the
addition of a new Section G2408.5.1, to read as follows:

G2408.5.1 Open-flame devices. Outdoor open-flame cooking devices and fixed -in-
place appliances will not be allowed on any combustible surface or within 10-feet (3048
mm) of combustible construction.

Exception: Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an automatic
sprinkler system.

N. Section G2413.3 is amended by the addition of Table G2413.2 to read as follows:

TABLE G2413.2 (402.2)
APPROXIMATE GAS INPUT FOR TYPICAL APPLIANCES
APPLIANCE INPUT/BTU/H
(Approx.)
Space Heating Units
Hydronic boiler
Single family 100,000
Multi-family, per unit 60,000
Warm-air furnace
Single family 100,000
Multi-family, per unit 60,000
Space and Water Heating Units
Hydronic boiler
Single family 120,000
Multi-family, per unit 75,000
Water Heating Appliances
Water heater, automatic instantaneous
Capacity at 2 gal/minute 142,800
Capacity at 4 gal/minute 285,000
Capacity at 6 gal/minute 428,400
Water heater, automatic storage, 30- to 40-gal tank 35,000
Water heater, automatic storage, 50-gal tank 50,000
Water heater, domestic, circulating or side-arm 35,000
Cooking Appliances
Built-in oven or broiler unit, domestic 25,000
Built-in top unit, domestic 40,000
Range, free standing, domestic : 65,000
Other Appliances

11



Barbeque 40,000
Clothes dryer, Type 1 (domestic) 35,000
Gas fireplace, direct-vent 40,000
Gas light 2,500
Gas log 80,000
Refrigerator 3,000

For SI: 1 British thermal unit per hour = 0.293 W, 1 gallon =3.785 L,
1 gallon per minute — 3.785 L/m

0. Section G2417.4.1, Test pressure, is amended to read in its entirety as follows:

G2417.4.1 Test pressure. The test pressure to be used shall be no less than 1% times
the proposed maximum working pressure but not less than 10 psi.

15.06.040 - Violation; penalty.

A. The Chief Building Official, Fire Code Official or any other designated Town official
shall be empowered to issue citations, stop work orders, cease and desist orders or closure orders to
any person found in violation of this Chapter.

B. Any person who violates any of the provisions of this Chapter shall be punished by a
fine of not more $1,000.00 or by imprisonment not to exceed one year, or by both such fine and
imprisonment.

C. Each such person shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every day during
any portion of which any violation is committed, continued or permitted by such person.

D. Commencement of work without a valid permit as required under this Title 15 may be
. subject to payment of an additional fee in the amount equal to the original permit fee and in addition
to the required permit fee.

Section 3. Repeal and Reenactment. Chapter 15.08 of the Castle Rock Municipal Code
is repealed in its entirety and reenacted to read as follows:

Chapter 15.08
International Mechanical Code

15.08.010 Adoption.

A. The Town adopts by reference the following code: International Mechanical Code,
2018 Edition, regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materjals, erection,
installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement and addition to, use or maintenance of
mechanical systems in Castle Rock, as hereafter set out (published by the International Code Council,
Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795).

12




B. The subject matter of the code concerns regulations to provide minimum requirements
to safeguard the public health, safety and general welfare through structural strength, means of egress
facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate light and ventilation, energy conservation and safety to life
and property from fire and other hazards attributed to the built environment; and to provide safety to
firefighters and emergency responders during emergency operations.

C. One copy and an electronic version of the above-referenced code shall be maintained
on file at the Development Services Department, and may be inspected during regular business hours,
the same being adopted as if set out at length herein.

15.08.020 Application.

The provisions of the adopted code shall apply to the construction, alteration, moving of
buildings, demolition, repair and use of any building or structure within the Town, except work located
primarily in a public way, public utility towers and poles, mechanical equipment not specifically
regulated by code and hydraulic flood control structures. Applicants may submit permit applications
and plan reviews in compliance with these adopted codes prior to August 1, 2019. Master Production
Plans, those submitted to the Town for reuse on a minimum of four structures, should comply with the
provisions in these adopted codes by January 1, 2020. One copy of an engineer-stamped truss design,
one engineer-stamped plan set along with one electronic CD of each is required for all Master
Production Plans. Required construction documents shall be submitted electronically, in PDF format.
Construction drawings shall be drawn to an appropriate scale. Any document (plans, drawings,
reports, surveys, etc.) prepared by an architect or engineer must bear such architect or engineers seal
and signature.

15.08.030 Amendments.

The following amendments, additions and deletions are made to the International Mechanical
Code:

A. Section R101.1, Title, is amended to read in its entirety as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Mechanical Code of The Town of
Castle Rock, hereinafter referred to as "this code."

B. Section 901, General, is amended to add a new Section 901.5, Solid-fuel-burning
equipment, to read as follows:

SECTION 901 - SOLID-FUEL-BURNING EQUIPMENT

901.5 Solid-fuel-burning equipment. No permit shall be issued for the installation of
a solid-fuel-burning fireplace stove, fireplace insert or wood stove appliance unless the
appliance fully conforms with the requirements for emissions testing, certification and
labeling found under Title 30, Article 28, Sections 402-405, Colorado Revised Statutes. All
such appliances to be installed must be certified by the Air Pollution Control Division of the
Colorado Department of Health to meet the emissions standards set forth in Section IV of

13




